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6 messages

Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id> Tue, Apr 12, 2022 at 11:56 PM
To: submission@rjoas.com

Dear Sir/Madam,

Herewith attached the manuscript entitled Network of Stakeholders: The Case of Bongkasa Pertiwi and Pangsan
Tourism Village in Bali Province, Indonesia to be published in 

RJOAS: Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences

Please kindly review my manuscript.

Regards
Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi
Lecturer at Bali State Polytechnic
Indonesia

Network of Stakeholders_RJOAS.doc
152K

Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> Wed, Apr 13, 2022 at 1:17 AM
To: Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id>

Hello,
 
files received and will be reviewed for issue of May 2022 within 14 working days.
Regards,
Sergey Plygun
 
on behalf of the Editorial Office
Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences (RJOAS)
https://rjoas.com/
 
RJOAS is a part of iVolga Press managed in cooperation with PT. Lentera Akademika Nusantara
https://ivolgapress.com/
 
 
 
12.04.2022, 19:02, "Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi" <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id>:

Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Herewith attached the manuscript entitled Network of Stakeholders: The Case of Bongkasa Pertiwi and
Pangsan Tourism Village in Bali Province, Indonesia to be published in 

RJOAS: Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=93b0d6b234&view=att&th=1801e7df3ca3c4fe&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_l1wbtd6u0&safe=1&zw
https://rjoas.com/
https://ivolgapress.com/
mailto:ikdewi@pnb.ac.id
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Please kindly review my manuscript.
 
Regards
Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi
Lecturer at Bali State Polytechnic
Indonesia
 
 
 
 

 

Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id> Thu, Apr 14, 2022 at 12:02 PM
To: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>

Thank you for your response. 

On Wed, Apr 13, 2022 at 1:17 AM Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> wrote:
Hello,
 
files received and will be reviewed for issue of May 2022 within 14 working days.
Regards,
Sergey Plygun
 
on behalf of the Editorial Office
Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences (RJOAS)
https://rjoas.com/
 
RJOAS is a part of iVolga Press managed in cooperation with PT. Lentera Akademika Nusantara
https://ivolgapress.com/
 
 
 
12.04.2022, 19:02, "Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi" <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id>:

Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Herewith attached the manuscript entitled Network of Stakeholders: The Case of Bongkasa Pertiwi
and Pangsan Tourism Village in Bali Province, Indonesia to be published in 

RJOAS: Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences

Please kindly review my manuscript.
 
Regards
Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi
Lecturer at Bali State Polytechnic
Indonesia
 
 
 
 

 

Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> Wed, Apr 20, 2022 at 10:33 PM
To: Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id>

Hello,
 

mailto:rjoas@yandex.ru
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mailto:ikdewi@pnb.ac.id
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by the decision of Editorial Board your paper is recommended for publishing in issue 5(125) of May 2022.
In order to continue with publishing process, please initiate processing fee transfer according to following details:
 
PayPal. To complete PayPal transfer, please use following quick payment link: https://www.paypal.com/
paypalme/ayutirta/132usd
Transfer can be completed till May 10, 2022, and it should contain appropriate note as: Donation for iVolga Press, and
Last name of paper's submitting author. Please be advised: transfers without appropriate note will take longer time to be
verified and confirmed to authors.
 
Bank transfer. It can be completed in USD or IDR depending on your choice. Details as follows:
 
Account number: 41-2248-2753
Account's Holder Name: I Gusti Ayu Tirtayani
Bank: Permata Bank (Indonesia)
Account Currency: IDR
Amount for transfer: 1.980.000,00
 
or
 
Account number: 41-3483-9983
Account's Holder Name: I Gusti Ayu Tirtayani
Bank: Permata Bank (Indonesia)
Swift code: BBBAIDJA
Account Currency: USD
Amount for transfer: 132
 
Verifying bank transfer usually takes few hours, in order to speed up the process we asking (if possible) to inform us
about sent transaction.
 
Processing fee include regular fee of 125 USD with fee commision coverage of 7 USD.
 
If you'll experience difficulties or have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact us!
 
Regards,
Sergey Plygun
 
on behalf of the Editorial Office
Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences (RJOAS)
https://rjoas.com/
 
RJOAS is a part of iVolga Press managed in cooperation with PT. Lentera Akademika Nusantara
https://ivolgapress.com/
 
 
 
12.04.2022, 19:02, "Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi" <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id>:

Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Herewith attached the manuscript entitled Network of Stakeholders: The Case of Bongkasa Pertiwi and
Pangsan Tourism Village in Bali Province, Indonesia to be published in 

RJOAS: Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences

Please kindly review my manuscript.
 
Regards
Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi
Lecturer at Bali State Polytechnic
Indonesia
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Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id> Fri, Apr 22, 2022 at 7:28 PM
To: Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru>

Dear Mr Plygun,

Herewith attached the evidence of transfer payment for my article: Network of Stakeholders: The Case of Bongkasa
Pertiwi and Pangsan Tourism Village in Bali Province, Indonesia.
Thankyou.

Sincerely 
Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi 

On Wed, Apr 20, 2022 at 10:36 PM Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> wrote:
Hello,
 
by the decision of Editorial Board your paper is recommended for publishing in issue 5(125) of May 2022.
In order to continue with publishing process, please initiate processing fee transfer according to following details:
 
PayPal. To complete PayPal transfer, please use following quick payment link: https://www.paypal.com/
paypalme/ayutirta/132usd
Transfer can be completed till May 10, 2022, and it should contain appropriate note as: Donation for iVolga Press, and
Last name of paper's submitting author. Please be advised: transfers without appropriate note will take longer time to
be verified and confirmed to authors.
 
Bank transfer. It can be completed in USD or IDR depending on your choice. Details as follows:
 
Account number: 41-2248-2753
Account's Holder Name: I Gusti Ayu Tirtayani
Bank: Permata Bank (Indonesia)
Account Currency: IDR
Amount for transfer: 1.980.000,00
 
or
 
Account number: 41-3483-9983
Account's Holder Name: I Gusti Ayu Tirtayani
Bank: Permata Bank (Indonesia)
Swift code: BBBAIDJA
Account Currency: USD
Amount for transfer: 132
 
Verifying bank transfer usually takes few hours, in order to speed up the process we asking (if possible) to inform us
about sent transaction.
 
Processing fee include regular fee of 125 USD with fee commision coverage of 7 USD.
 
If you'll experience difficulties or have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact us!
 
Regards,
Sergey Plygun
 
on behalf of the Editorial Office
Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences (RJOAS)
https://rjoas.com/
 
RJOAS is a part of iVolga Press managed in cooperation with PT. Lentera Akademika Nusantara
https://ivolgapress.com/
 
 
 
12.04.2022, 19:02, "Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi" <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id>:
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Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Herewith attached the manuscript entitled Network of Stakeholders: The Case of Bongkasa Pertiwi
and Pangsan Tourism Village in Bali Province, Indonesia to be published in 

RJOAS: Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences

Please kindly review my manuscript.
 
Regards
Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi
Lecturer at Bali State Polytechnic
Indonesia
 
 
 
 

 

RJOAS-Payment for article of Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi.pdf
67K

Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> Sat, Apr 23, 2022 at 1:44 AM
To: Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id>

Hello,
 
thank you for your kind support, transfer verified; LoA for paper attached to the letter.
 
Regards,
Sergey Plygun
 
on behalf of the Editorial Office
Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences (RJOAS)
https://rjoas.com/
 
RJOAS is a part of iVolga Press managed in cooperation with PT. Lentera Akademika Nusantara
https://ivolgapress.com/
 
 
 
22.04.2022, 14:28, "Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi" <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id>:

Dear Mr Plygun,
 
Herewith attached the evidence of transfer payment for my article: Network of Stakeholders: The Case of
Bongkasa Pertiwi and Pangsan Tourism Village in Bali Province, Indonesia.
Thankyou.
 
Sincerely 
Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi 
 
On Wed, Apr 20, 2022 at 10:36 PM Plygun Sergey <rjoas@yandex.ru> wrote:

Hello,
 
by the decision of Editorial Board your paper is recommended for publishing in issue 5(125) of May 2022.
In order to continue with publishing process, please initiate processing fee transfer according to following
details:
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PayPal. To complete PayPal transfer, please use following quick payment link: https://www.paypal.com/
paypalme/ayutirta/132usd
Transfer can be completed till May 10, 2022, and it should contain appropriate note as: Donation for
iVolga Press, and Last name of paper's submitting author. Please be advised: transfers without
appropriate note will take longer time to be verified and confirmed to authors.
 
Bank transfer. It can be completed in USD or IDR depending on your choice. Details as follows:
 
Account number: 41-2248-2753
Account's Holder Name: I Gusti Ayu Tirtayani
Bank: Permata Bank (Indonesia)
Account Currency: IDR
Amount for transfer: 1.980.000,00
 
or
 
Account number: 41-3483-9983
Account's Holder Name: I Gusti Ayu Tirtayani
Bank: Permata Bank (Indonesia)
Swift code: BBBAIDJA
Account Currency: USD
Amount for transfer: 132
 
Verifying bank transfer usually takes few hours, in order to speed up the process we asking (if possible)
to inform us about sent transaction.
 
Processing fee include regular fee of 125 USD with fee commision coverage of 7 USD.
 
If you'll experience difficulties or have any questions, please do not hesitate to contact us!
 
Regards,
Sergey Plygun
 
on behalf of the Editorial Office
Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences (RJOAS)
https://rjoas.com/
 
RJOAS is a part of iVolga Press managed in cooperation with PT. Lentera Akademika Nusantara
https://ivolgapress.com/
 
 
 
12.04.2022, 19:02, "Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi" <ikdewi@pnb.ac.id>:

Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Herewith attached the manuscript entitled Network of Stakeholders: The Case of
Bongkasa Pertiwi and Pangsan Tourism Village in Bali Province, Indonesia to be
published in 

RJOAS: Russian Journal of Agricultural and Socio-Economic Sciences

Please kindly review my manuscript.
 
Regards
Nyoman Indah Kusuma Dewi
Lecturer at Bali State Polytechnic
Indonesia
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