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IJBMER Publication <submit@ijbmer.org> Mon, Apr 10, 2023 at 1:07 PM

To: rasumaputri@gmail.com

Dear Author
| Komang Mahayana Putra

Thank you for submitting the manuscript to the International Journal of Business Management and Economic
Review, the submitted research paper has been sent to the reviewer panel.

Paper title1: DOES CELEBRITY ENDORSER EFFECT PURCHASE INTENTION?
Paper ID: BMER1643

Submission Date: 09/04/2023

We will get back to you after review within 5 to 7 days.

Thank you for considering this journal as a venue for your work.

With Regards,

Editor-in-Chief

(International Journal of Business Management and Economic Review)
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To: Ni Made Dwiyana Rasuma Putri <rasumaputri@gmail.com>

Dear Author
| Komang Mahayana Putra

Congratulations! The Editorial Team of the International Journal of Business Management and Economic Review
(IJBMER), is pleased to inform you that your manuscript. “DOES CELEBRITY ENDORSER EFFECT PURCHASE
INTENTION ?” has been accepted for publication.

Please find the attachment for Acceptance Letter and copyright form and pay the publication fee 80 USD through
Paypal using debit or credit card by this link: ( http://ijomer.org/modeofpayment.php ) using email ( editor@ijbmer.org)
and complete all formality as soon as possible so that we can proceed with the publication.

With Regards

Editor-in-Chief

IJBMER

(International Journal of Business Management and Economic Review)
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alpinus publications <ijpbmer1@gmail.com> Tue, Apr 11, 2023 at 1:05 PM
To: Ni Made Dwiyana Rasuma Putri <rasumaputri@gmail.com>

Dear author,

Congratulation your paper titled " DOES CELEBRITY ENDORSER EFFECT PURCHASE INTENTION? " has been
successfully published in the current issue

Link-https://ijpmer.org/view5.php?issue=2
Note - Please find the attachment certificate of publication.
If you need the hard copy (print version) of the current issue you need to send a complete postal address and a hard

copy charges 30 USD for each Copy
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On Mon, Apr 10, 2023 at 6:00 PM Ni Made Dwiyana Rasuma Putri <rasumaputri@gmail.com> wrote:
Great, thank you so much!

On Mon, Apr 10, 2023, 7:21 PM alpinus publications <ijobmer1@gmail.com> wrote:
Thank you we will back to you soon with successful publication
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On Mon, Apr 10, 2023 at 3:31 PM Ni Made Dwiyana Rasuma Putri <rasumaputri@gmail.com> wrote:
So sorry. This is our payment proof and final manuscript. Thank you.

On Mon, Apr 10, 2023 at 4:59 PM Ni Made Dwiyana Rasuma Putri <rasumaputri@gmail.com> wrote:
Thank you for your mail. Hereby we attach payment proof, copyright form, and final manuscript. Please
kindly check it and do the needful. Best Regards.
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