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Ni Made Sudarmini <madesudarmini@pnb.ac.id>

Fwd: Word format of the paper Request- Doc or Docx format
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Ni Wayan Sukartini <wayansukartini@pnb.ac.id> Sat, May 27, 2023 at 1:08 PM
To: madesudarmini@pnb.ac.id

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com>
Date: Wed, Dec 4, 2019 at 1:24 PM
Subject: Word format of the paper Request- Doc or Docx format
To: Ni Wayan Sukartini <wayansukartini@pnb.ac.id>

Dear Sir/Madam

You have submitted only PDF format of the paper at the time of Submission.
Kindly send the final word format of the paper after doing all the corrections for
formatting purpose (Doc or Docx) format. Waiting for your response.

On Wed, Dec 4, 2019 at 10:52 AM Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam                                          

Received the publication fee. Within 2 days time period, paper will be formatted
as per our journal format and you will get the email from our editing
Department for the same. Thanks for your prompt response.

On Tue, Dec 3, 2019 at 11:47 AM Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:
 

Received the payment made evidence. Normally all foreign transaction will
take 3 to 5 days time period to credit the money into our account. After
receiving the money, paper will be published in online. We will inform the
status of the paper
Thanks
          
On Tue, Dec 3, 2019 at 7:30 AM Ni Wayan Sukartini <wayansukartini@pnb.ac.id> wrote:

Dear Mr/Mrs
I have already transfered $450 for publication of my paper publishing on IJM/10/06/2019 

Regards
Ni Wayan Sukartini

On Sat, Nov 30, 2019, 5:57 PM Ni Wayan Sukartini <wayansukartini@pnb.ac.id> wrote:
Ok..I will, thank You
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On Sat, Nov 30, 2019, 5:50 PM Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:
Dear sir/Madam
ok. After paying the fee, kindly inform us.
Thank you

On Sat, Nov 30, 2019 at 1:40 PM Ni Wayan Sukartini <wayansukartini@pnb.ac.id> wrote:
Ok...I will transfer on Monday or Tuesday. Ths for the  remainder

Regards
Ni Wayan Sukartini

On Sat, Nov 30, 2019, 4:02 PM Chief Editor, IAEME Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:
Dear N. W. Sukartini, A. A. A. M. Kencanawati and N. K. Lasmini

As you aware that, your paper was accepted for publication in our
journal and acceptance letter send to your e-mail address.

 
But still now, we haven’t received the Publication fee after the
acceptance letter issued by IAEME. Kindly send it immediately, so
that we can publish your paper in this issue. We are waiting for your
response.
 
(If you completed the payment procedures, please ignore this
message)
 
Thanks and Regards
Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
President & Chief Editor
IAEME
Plot : 03, Flat- S 1, Poomalai Santosh Pearls Apartment
Plot No. 10, Vaiko Salai 6th Street
Jai Shankar Nagar, Palavakkam, Chennai- 600 041
 

We would like to inform you that your paper titled “Business
Performance and Competitive Advantage: Multi Perspective
Analysis of SMEs in Bali” has been accepted for publication in
International Journal of Management (IJM), Volume 10, Issue 6,
(November-December 2019) issue of the journal based on the
Recommendation of the Editorial Board without any major corrections in
the content submitted by the researcher
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This letter is the official confirmation of acceptance of your research paper.
 
Your research work is licensed under a Creative Commons
Attribution 4.0 (International) License. (CC BY-NC 4.0). Hence no
need to submit the Copyright form.
 
Your research paper will be appearing in IJM, Volume 10, Issue 6,
November-December 2019.
 
International Journal of Management (IJM)
Journal Impact Factor (2019): 9.6780 Calculated by GISI
ISSN Print:   0976-6502
ISSN Online: 0976-6510
 
Review Comments are attached along with the mail.
 
Kindly send the Publication fee of $ 450/- (Online only). The Online
Only mode includes online publication of paper, indexing of paper in more
than 20 search engines and soft copy of the publication certificate.
 
You can deposit the money in the account or transfer the money and send
the scan copy of payment made evidence through e-mail.

Account Details
 
Account Number 1911683597
Name of the Account IAEME Publication
Bank Kotak Mahindra Bank Ltd
Branch T. Nagar Branch
Address of the Bank Ground Floor, Shree Essarar Towers, 41

Venkatnarayana Road, T.Nagar, Chennai -
600017, Tamil Nadu, India

Type of Account Current
Swift Code KKBKINBBXXX
IFSC CODE KKBK0000468
MICR CODE 600485008

 
Kindly acknowledge the Paper acceptance. Thanks and looking to receive
the payment from your side at the earliest. Publication fee should be paid
within 10 days time period after receipt of the acceptance letter.
 
Thank & Regards.

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication
Plot: 03, Flat- S 1,
Poomalai Santosh Pearls Apartment
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Plot No. 10, Vaiko Salai 6th Street
Jai Shankar Nagar
Palavakkam, Chennai- 600 041
Tamilnadu, India, Mobile: 09884798314
E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com
Website: www.iaeme.com   
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