From: TEM Journal <temjournal@gmail com=>
Date: 15 November 2018 15.23.04 GMT+8
To: putuindah@pnb. ac id

Subject: TEM Journal

Dear Putu Indah Ciptayani,

We have received yvour manuscript and forwarded it to reviewers.
Thank you for sending.

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office
office@temjournal.com
temjournali@gmail.com
W temjoumal. com

( “ Reply ) (H Forward)

From: TEM Journal <temjournali@gmail.com=
Date: 5 March 2020 01.38.01 GMT+3

To: undisclosed-recipients:;

Subject: TEM Journal

Dear Authors,

Your paper has been published in Tem Journal, Vol.9, No.1
Online version can be viewed and downloaded from www.itemjournal com
In the following days we will upload the Journal in the bases and the catalogues on Internet.

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office,
office@temjournal.com
temjoumal@gmail.com
vy temjoumal.com

( 4 Reply ) (r—) Forwarcl)

On Thu, Feb 13, 2020 at 4:19 AM Putu Indah Ciptayani <putuindah@pnb ac id= wrote:
Dear TEM Journal,

Here we attach the final version of our paper based on the review.

On Thu, Feb 13, 2020 at 2:31 AM TEM Joumnal <temjournal@gmail.com> wrote
Dear Putu Indah Ciptayani,

We are entering the finale phase in publishing process, for TEM Journal Vol.9, No.1. (in last week of February, 2020)
If you want the paper to be published in this issue. vou should submit us as soon as possible the corrected paper.

Best Regards,
Editorial Board office,
office@temjournal com

temjournali@gmail. com

www temjournal. com

©On Wed, Feb 5, 2020 at 4:41 PM TEM Journal <temjournal@agmail.conm= wrote:
Dear Putu Indah Ciptayani,

You did not provide the following references in the text:[22], [23]. [24].

All the references that you have listed under section References must be cited in the text where you have used them.
If you have not specified them in the text, do not list them under section References.

After the corrections you should send us your paper again.

Best Regards,
Editorial Board office,



Your paper “A Custom-based Crossover Technique in Genetic Algorithm for Course Scheduling Problem™
has been accepted to be published and printed in Tem Journal Vol.9, No.1, {in last week of February, 2020).

Please sign copyright agreement form, and send a scanned copy back to us.
Publication fee (covers: publishing, review and databases indexing costs): 400 euros.

It is necessary to make the payment within 6 days. If vou do not make the payment within that time peried, we will publish the

paper in the next issue.
After payment, please inform us.
In attachments, you can find details about how to pay publication fee

TYour paper may not be published elsewhere (journal, scientific conference, etc.), in substantially the same form, in English or in

any other language

Best Regards,
Editorial Board office,
office/@temjournal.com

temjournali@gmail.com
wnw.femjournal.com

On Thu, Feb 13, 2020 at 2:27 PM TEM Journal <temjournal@amail.com= wrote:
Dear Putu Indah Ciptayani.

The paper has been accepted by two reviewers.
At the moment it is undergoing a language verification.

Soon we will inform vou about the complete review.

Best Regards,

Q, TEM journal X
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Dear Authors,

Your paper has been published in Tem Journal, Vol.9, No.1
Online version can be viewed and downloaded from www.temjournal com
In the following days we will upload the Journal in the bases and the catalogues on Internet.

Best Regards,
Editorial Board office,
office(@iemjournal.com
temjournal@gmail.com
www. temjournal. com
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Dear Ida Bagus Irawan Purnama,

All papers published in TEM Joumal in 2020 are covered by SCOPUS too.
https:/‘wiww.scopus.com/sourceid' 21100831441 Porigin=sbrowse

They are acquiring materials from our website automatically, and now is everything slowly because of this world situation. We hope that it will be soon.

Best Regards,

Editorial Board office,
officei@iemjournal.com
temjoumal@omail.com
wwnw femjoumnal.com
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